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LIBRO CAMPOS PROYECTOS  2014

Referencia: 1

IWO71-14

Address:

SEOULLocation:

CULTURE VILLAGE (CARTA DE MOTIVACIÓN)Name:
Name:

2014Year:Code:

Url: www.1.or.kr

YOUTH  - Youth workProject:

30Max Age:18Min Age:14/07/2014Final Date:02/07/2014Initial Date:

2Places:

Descripction of 
Workcamp:

IWO-71


Culture Village NONSAN 02 JUL - 14 JUL YOUTH/ART 15 vols


Nonsan(http://goo.gl/wCyiBk) is located in the lower part of Korea and about 
180km away from Seoul. There are many historical places around in Nonsan. 


Youth in Nonsan has disadvantages in accessing cultural exposes and various 
experiences as like other locals. Therefore, SangsangMadang Nonsan is 
established in order to support the creative performance and young artist. It also 
provides educational opportunities to local youth on exhibition, concert and 
festival. 





Work: Participants will organize a global youth camp for 3 days 2 times based on 
their traditional culture for a local youth. During this project, 30~60 youth, ages 
14~17 in a local take part in a summer camp. The motto in this project is not only 
to support them to understand different cultures but also to make them creatively 
think by making a performance together. Games, songs, and craft ideas from your 
countries will help give the camp an international flair! At first week, you will have 
a time to plan, where your creative side is needed to prepare activities for the 
youth. However, you have to keep in mind that they are unfamiliar with speaking 
English. 


Accommodation and food: Guest house in Sangsangmadang / Meals are provided 
and self-catering.


Location&Terminal: Nonsan, Chungnam / Incheon international airport, Nonsan 
train station


Leisure Activities: Visiting historical places. (Temple, museum) 


Requirements: Interest in artistic performance & Highly motivated for youth 
activities.





INSURANCE





The camps insurance covers only part of the real costs for health and third part 
liability expenses caused by accidents during the project. Volunteers are strongly 
advised to purchase a travel insurance before departure from their country.
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LIBRO CAMPOS PROYECTOS  2014

Referencia: 2

IWO72-14

Address:

SEOULLocation:

ACTIONS FOR A LOCAL (CARTA DE MOTIVACIÓN)Name:
Name:

2014Year:Code:

Url: www.1.or.kr

ENVI  - EnvironmentalProject:

30Max Age:18Min Age:25/07/2014Final Date:15/07/2014Initial Date:

2Places:

Descripction of 
Workcamp:

IWO-72


Actions for a Local BUSAN15 JUL - 25 JUL ENVI 15 vols


Busan(http://goo.gl/maps/YxVBH) is the second biggest city in Korea and about 
400km away from Seoul. It is famous with port, food and various cultures because 
historically it has ever been the gate to all different kind of cultures from abroad. 
Present and past heritages exist together harmoniously.This project is held in 
cooperation with Haeundae Volunteer center in order to promote the citizenship 
through voluntary service. International volunteers in this project will join various 
activities and campaign to achieve the objectives. 





Work: Participants will do mural painting at the old wall along the village in 
Songjeong train station, in order to decorate in various ways, which is the 
historical building in Busan. Haeundae beach is famous in Korean but also has the 
issues related with environment due to a lot of visitors. Mostly, visitors throw away 
a lot of trash throughout this area during the night. Participants will join the 
campaign and action to preserve the beach around. 





Accommodation and Food: Guest house / Self-catering within a group


Location and Terminal: Haeundae-gu, Busan / Incheon international airport, Busan 
train station


Leisure Activities: Visiting historical places and beach in Busan during a free day.





INSURANCE





The camps insurance covers only part of the real costs for health and third part 
liability expenses caused by accidents during the project. Volunteers are strongly 
advised to purchase a travel insurance before departure from their country.
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Referencia: 3

IWO73-14

Address:

SEOULLocation:

YOUTH EMPOWERING (CARTA DE MOTIVACIÓN)Name:
Name:

2014Year:Code:

Url: www.1.or.kr

YOUTH  - Youth workProject:

30Max Age:18Min Age:02/08/2014Final Date:21/07/2014Initial Date:

2Places:

Descripction of 
Workcamp:

IWO-73


Youth Empowering WANDO 21 JUL - 02 AUG YOUTH15 vols


Wando(http://goo.gl/maps/e9PVP) is an island located in south about 500km away 
from Seoul to south. It has a bridge to mainland so that people can reach there 
conveniently by any transportation. Wando is famous with sea foods and beautiful 
landscape. However, there are depopulation issues especially for youth because 
their parents focus on better condition of an education so that many youth move 
to a bigger city these days. International exchange and experience is rare to these 
local children as well. Therefore, this project focuses on providing new experience 
to local youth & children through international volunteers such as diverse cultures 
and education programs in cooperation with the host organization. The host is 
local children center which is providing social and educational service for children 
and youth in Wando. 





Work: Participants will organize global culture camp for 5 days. There are 20-30 
local children in a camp who doesn't speak English well. Any kind of activities and 
ideas from volunteers are very welcome such as traditional cultures, sports, play, 
choir, drawing, learning workshop and so on.


                                  


Accommodation and Food: In the local children center / Meals are provided and 
self-catering.


Location and Terminal: Wando, Jeonnam / Incheon international airport, Wando 
bus terminal


Leisure activities: Visiting a beach and famous tourist sites around. 





INSURANCE





The camps insurance covers only part of the real costs for health and third part 
liability expenses caused by accidents during the project. Volunteers are strongly 
advised to purchase a travel insurance before departure from their country.
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Referencia: 4

IWO75-14

Address:

SEOULLocation:

WORLD IN NATURE (CARTA DE MOTIVACIÓN)Name:
Name:

2014Year:Code:

Url: www.1.or.kr

YOUTH  - Youth workProject:

30Max Age:18Min Age:09/08/2014Final Date:27/07/2014Initial Date:

2Places:

Descripction of 
Workcamp:

IWO-75


World in Nature GOKSEONG 27 JUL - 09 AUG YOUTH15 vols


Gokseong(http://goo.gl/maps/kZ6l0) is about 250km away to south. It has easy 
access from Seoul by train so that it takes about 3 hours. It is famous with clean 
and healthy region in Korea. This project is held in cooperation with Gokseong 
Peace school which is an alternative middle school. The school is aimed at peaceful 
life, eco-friendly life, independent living and understanding different cultures. This 
project is based on these philosophies. 





Work: Participants will organize and run the Global village project(Intercultural 
youth camp) for Korean youth(ages 14~17). 


This project will have various activities related with environment, human right, 
intercultural understanding through food, costume, social issues and so on in order 
to develop the global citizenship of Korean youth. Participants are required to 
bring interesting, educational ideas and materials to prepare the project. Mostly 
the activities will be based on experiencing outdoor activities and understanding 
different cultures. 





Accommodation and Food: In the school dormitory, / Meals are provided


Location and Terminal: Gokseong, Jeonnam / Incheon international airport, 
Gwangju train station


Leisure Activities: Outdoor activities such as hiking, bicycle riding along a river, 
swimming 


Remark: Interest in running the outdoor camp & Highly motivated for youth 
activities.





INSURANCE





The camps insurance covers only part of the real costs for health and third part 
liability expenses caused by accidents during the project. Volunteers are strongly 
advised to purchase a travel insurance before departure from their country.
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Referencia: 5

IWO77-14

Address:

SEOULLocation:

NATURE IS SCHOOL (CARTA DE MOTIVACIÓN)Name:
Name:

2014Year:Code:

Url: www.1.or.kr

YOUTH-CULT  - Youth work-CulturalProject:

30Max Age:18Min Age:09/08/2014Final Date:28/07/2014Initial Date:

2Places:

Descripction of 
Workcamp:

IWO-77


Nature is School GONGJU 28 JUL - 09 AUG YOUTH/CULT 15 vols


Gongju(http://goo.gl/maps/dfCqn) is about 150 km away from Seoul and located 
in the center of South Chungcheong province. This city is an ancient of Baekje 
Kingdom, where brilliant Baekje culture flourished, Gongju is a city of history, 
culture and tourism. As Korea's local society is aging rapidly and the population is 
decreasing, the host organization called 'Chungnam education institute' is focusing 
on the youths who are isolated from high education opportunities. The host 
organization believes that local is one of the critical factors supporting Korea's 
society. Every year, host organization opens summer school for a local and youth 
in order to teach them the value of local and nature. Participants will join in the 
summer camp as assistants so that they will create new dynamics in the programs 
by introducing international cultures. 





Work: Participants simply organize and join in every activities of the summer 
school such as sports days, role play, inter-cultural food days with about 40 


young Korean youth 3 times. The programs in the summer school are focusing on 
local community, culture exchange, eco-friendly activities. Participants should 


be active to be mingled with youth as assistants and also need to introduce their 
own cultures such as foods, dance and songs. You will learn how to run a 


youth project, how to work in a large team. The youth will stay at the camp, but 
your group will return to your accommodation.





Accommodation and food: Rooms in the education center / Meals are provided and 
Self-catering


Leisure Activities: Visiting historic place in Gongju


Location&Terminal: Gongju, Chungnam / Incheon international airport, Gongju Bus 
Terminal 


Requirements: Very active participation in outdoor activities. Highly interest to be 
engaged with Youth.





INSURANCE





The camps insurance covers only part of the real costs for health and third part 
liability expenses caused by accidents during the project. Volunteers are strongly 
advised to purchase a travel insurance before departure from their country.
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Referencia: 6

IWO78-14

Address:

SEOULLocation:

MOVE TO ENVIRONMENT (CARTA DE MOTIVACIÓN)Name:
Name:

2014Year:Code:

Url: www.1.or.kr

ENVI  - EnvironmentalProject:

30Max Age:18Min Age:09/08/2014Final Date:28/07/2014Initial Date:

2Places:

Descripction of 
Workcamp:

IWO-78


Move to EnvironmentBUSAN28 JUL - 09 AUG ENVI 15 vols


Busan(http://goo.gl/68Kk8p) is the 2nd biggest city and the largest port city in 
Korea and it¿s about 400km away from Seoul to south. The more Busan advances, 
the more the environment concern increases. This project is organized in 
cooperation with 'Local agenda 21 for Busan' which is association of various 
environment organizations in Busan. This organization would like to renovate the 
rural area in Busan with ecological ways. So, volunteers will have various activities 
to solve the local issue and 


environment in Busan. 





Work: Participants will help a local people to clean a village and do gardening, 
mural painting as one of the village renovation. In addition, participants will be 
involved in monitoring an ecosystem at the nakdong-river and cleaning this area. 
Participants should be motivated for eco-friendly activities. Participants also do 
running various campaigns with local youth which is related to raise the awareness 
of the value of eco-friendly ways for the renovation in Busan. 





Accommodation and food: Guest house in the local community. / Self catering 
within a group.


Location&Terminal: Busan / Incheon international airport, Busan train station


Leisure Activities: Leisure Activities: Volunteers may have a chance to visit 
historical places and enjoy the beach in Busan during a free day.


Requirements: Interest in eco-village and environment movement.





INSURANCE





The camps insurance covers only part of the real costs for health and third part 
liability expenses caused by accidents during the project. Volunteers are strongly 
advised to purchase a travel insurance before departure from their country.
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Referencia: 7

IWO83-14

Address:

SEOULLocation:

CREATIVE HILL (CARTA DE MOTIVACIÓN)Name:
Name:

2014Year:Code:

Url: www.1.or.kr

ART  - Art campProject:

30Max Age:18Min Age:25/08/2014Final Date:06/08/2014Initial Date:

2Places:

Descripction of 
Workcamp:

IWO-83


Creative Hill BUSAN06 AUG - 25 AUG ART 15 vols


Busan(http://goo.gl/maps/s4E9m) is the 2nd biggest city in Korea and it's about 
400km away from Seoul to south. This project is held in cooperation with 


'Art-in-nature' in Busan. They are specialized with installation art in the villages 
and city. They are interested in reviving the city outlook through art 


such as painting, making post, board, benches so on for non-profit purpose. The 
works will be exhibited in the art local festival. The project site is very 


unique due to its location. It's a small village in the very modern city but located in 
the mountain so that it has a fresh air and nice landscape with nature.





Work: The Art-in-nature marks the 10th anniversary in this year. The host has a 
plan to open a 10th art camp to celebrate and exhibit their work for people in 
Busan. Participants will work with artists on the wall and shops in the corner in 
order to renovate and create new design in the village. They will assist the 
exhibition of artists from other countries as well so that there are various physical 
works during a project. The artists are excited to work with international young 
people.





Accommodation and food: Guest house in Art-in-nature / Self-catering within a 
group


Location and Terminal: Seogu, Busan / Incheon international airport, Busan train 
station


Leisure Activities: Various tourist sites around the island and Busan during a free 
day.


Requirements: Highly motivated for physical work with artist.





INSURANCE





The camps insurance covers only part of the real costs for health and third part 
liability expenses caused by accidents during the project. Volunteers are strongly 
advised to purchase a travel insurance before departure from their country.
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Referencia: 8

IWO84-14

Address:

SEOULLocation:

WORLD HERITAGE (CARTA DE MOTIVACIÓN)Name:
Name:

2014Year:Code:

Url: www.1.or.kr

CULT  - CulturalProject:

30Max Age:18Min Age:16/08/2014Final Date:06/08/2014Initial Date:

2Places:

Descripction of 
Workcamp:

IWO-84


World Heritage GYEONGJU 06 AUG - 16 AUG CULT 15 vols


Gyeongju(http://goo.gl/maps/TcjUb) is 350km away from Seoul to east-south. 
There are many historical attractions enjoyed by many visitors and you are easy to 
find world heritage site in this city.


This project is selected as a project of WHV (World Heritage Volunteer) operated 
by UNESCO World Heritage Center and CCIVS (Coordinating Committee of 





International Voluntary Service). Project site is called 'Yangdong village' (http:
//whc.unesco.org/en/list/1324). 





The village puts efforts to preserve the village and promote the value of the village 
and heritages to visitors and public. However, people and money have 


come into Yangdong village indiscriminately and the village could be progressively 
commercialized without any spirit to integrate a real understanding about the 
village, its inhabitants and World Heritage. There are more senior citizens than 
young people living in the village, and few are capable to deal with these issues 
properly.





Especially, volunteers will run the World heritage awareness educational program 
and campaigns for visitors and local children. It has very easy access from Seoul 
by KTX(Express train) or express bus. 





Work: Participants will prepare and organize World heritage awareness educational 
programs based on non-formal education for visitors and local children. 





They will also renovate and clean the village pavilions of the World Heritage site.





Accommodation and food: The community center in town / Self-catering within a 
group


Location and Terminal: Yangdong village, Gyeongju / Incheon international airport, 
Gyeongju KTX train station.


Leisure Activities: Visiting historical places in Gyeongju city during a free day.


Requirement: Interest in learning Korean culture and world heritage.


Their experience and ideas are highly welcomed and applied. 





INSURANCE





The camps insurance covers only part of the real costs for health and third part 
liability expenses caused by accidents during the project. Volunteers are strongly 
advised to purchase a travel insurance before departure from their country.
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Referencia: 9

KNCU01-14

Address:

SEOULLocation:

JEJUName:
Name:

2014Year:Code:

Url: www.unesco.or.kr

CULT-KIDS  - Cultural - Work with kidsProject:

30Max Age:18Min Age:21/07/2014Final Date:08/07/2014Initial Date:

2Places:

Descripction of 
Workcamp:

Code: KNCU-01


Name: Jeju


Region: Seogwipo-si, Jeju-do


Country: Republic of Korea


Start date: 8 July 2014


End date: 21 July 2014


Type of work: CULT/KIDS


Number of vols: 10


Min age: 18


Max age: 30


Partner: Seogwipo YWCA (Cultural NGO), Jeju Provincial Office (Government)





Work: As part of the World Heritage Volunteers (WHV) project, KNCU-01 focuses 
on preservation and promotion of UNESCO's World Heritage Site, Jeju Volcanic 
Island and Lava Tubes. Jeju which was created by volcanic activity is known for its 
unique volcanic features, and the entire island itself is like a volcanic museum. 
There are 368 oreum on the island (&#8251; oreum: It means "small mountain" 
in Jeju dialect)and over 160 lava tubes are scattered on the island. It's very rare 
to see a small island that has both oreum and caves in the world. The value of Jeju 
was proved as the island received as the island was designated Biosphere Reserve 
in 2002, World Natural Heritage in 2007 and Global Geopark in 2010, making the 
sub-tropical island only place on Earth to receive all three UNESCO designations in 
natural sciences. Therefore, we believe that volunteer activities in Jeju should be 
made available not only to domestic youths but to youths around the world, to 
appreciate and preserve world heritage. Activities to preserve the site will include 
picking up trash, trimming the weeds, and conducting street campaigns just to 
name a few. In collaboration with Seogwipo YWCA, the volunteers will also have 
the opportunity to interact with local community children who come to Seogwipo 
YWCA as the after-school community learning centre. Here, you will teach them 
culture of your countries, games, as well as conduct activities to preserve the 
World Heritage together.


       


Accommodation and food: You will be living in the community centre next to 
Seowipo YWCA. It is equipped with two rooms, kitchen and a bathroom. The 
volunteers will need to take turns in cooking, showcasing their own food. On the 
first day, volunteers will gather to make a schedule as to who will cook, clean,etc. 


     


Special requirements: KNCU-01 requires volunteers who are motivated to learn 
about World Heritage and preserving the nature. We are also looking for 
volunteers who have experience working with children as a significant amount of 
time will be spent at YWCA.





Extra fee: None
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Extra fee: None


Languages: Primarily English


Airport: Jeju International Airport


Train station: N/A


Max vols per country: 2


Max national vols: 4





INSURANCE


KNCU provides insurance only for accidents during the Workcamp in Korea.
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Referencia: 10

KNCU02-14

Address:

SEOULLocation:

MUANName:
Name:

2014Year:Code:

Url: www.unesco.or.kr

ENVI-MANU  - Environmental-Manual workProject:

30Max Age:18Min Age:28/07/2014Final Date:15/07/2014Initial Date:

2Places:

Descripction of 
Workcamp:

Code: KNCU-02


Name: Muan


Region: Muan-gun, Jeolla-do


Country: Republic of Korea


Start date: 15 July 2014


End date: 28 July 2014


Type of work: ENVI/MANU


Number of vols: 10


Min age: 18


Max age: 30


Partner: Eco-Horizon (Environmental NGO), Muan-gun Provincial Office 
(Government)


       


Work: Muan-gun is a region in the Southwest of Korean peninsula. Renowned for 
its beautiful landscape and rich biodiversity, the coastal areas have been enlisted 
as the UNESCO World Heritage Tentative List and as a Biosphere Reserve. As the 
area is currently on the Tentative List, bringing together international volunteers 
around the world to promote the area and conduct campaigns to raise awareness 
would provide to be worthwhile experience for not only the volunteers but also the 
local residents. The volunteers can experience not only ecological but also cultural 
preservation and sustainability of 


local residents. The volunteers are expected to work at the coastal areas to 
preserve the natural beauty of the Tidal Flat. You will also have to work with the 
local residents, renovating the villages, contributing to the sustainability of the 
residents. Manual labour such as carrying stones, painting 


the walls, and helping construction work is expected. Lastly, there will be time to 
connect with the local middle school and high school students, where you will 
conduct cultural classes. 


       


Accommodation and food: You will be living in a nearby residential house. It is 
equipped with two rooms, kitchen and a bathroom. However, please be aware that 
the accommodations will meet the very minimum standards (no air-conditioner, 
for example) and you should be able to adapt to the hot weather 


as the temperature rises significantly during the summer season in the coastal 
area. The volunteers will need to take turns in cooking, showcasing their own 
cultural food. On the first day, volunteers will gather to make a schedule as to who 
will cook, clean, etc. 


       


Special requirements: None 


Extra fee: None


Languages: English


Airport: Incheon International Airport (ICN)


Train station: None. The volunteers will have to take Express Bus from Seoul to 
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Train station: None. The volunteers will have to take Express Bus from Seoul to 
Muan.


Max vols per country: 2


Max national vols: 5





INSURANCE


KNCU provides insurance only for accidents during the Workcamp in Korea.
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Referencia: 11

KNCU03-14

Address:

SEOULLocation:

INJEName:
Name:

2014Year:Code:

Url: www.unesco.or.kr

AGRI  - AgricultureProject:

30Max Age:18Min Age:28/07/2014Final Date:15/07/2014Initial Date:

2Places:

Descripction of 
Workcamp:

Code: KNCU-03


Name: Inje


Region: Inje-gun, Gangwon-do


Country: Republic of Korea


Start date: 15 July 2014


End date: 28 July 2014


Type of work: AGRI/MANU


Number of vols: 10


Min age: 18


Max age: 30


Partner: Korea DMZ Peace-Life Valley (NGO), Inje-gun Provincial Office 
(Government)


  


Work: It has been more than 50 years since the Korean peninsula has been torn 
apart by the Korean War. 





The Demilitarized Zone (DMZ) that splits our land into two, is the physical 
manifestation of our division. Even now, it is a reminder of our nation's pain and 
frustration, an endangering factor to world peace and a shame to civilization. 
Nevertheless, the whole area of DMZ is also the historical stage for an incredible 
ecological revival, bustling with nature and life which no manpower can substitute. 
The isolation form wars, conflicts and killings has transformed the territory into a 
peaceful habitat for wildlife. The Korea DMZ Peace & Life Valley deals with the pain 
of both of our divided countries, obligated to make this movement grounded upon 
mutual respect for differences.Such dedication and determination will be the basis 
for enacting the movement geared towards specifying and realizing the value of 
peace and life. In this respect, the work in KNCU-03 will be largely divided into 
two. First, the volunteers will have a chance to learn about the concept of peace, 
war and appreciation of the ecosystem. As DMZ carries a special meaning to the 
workcamp and the local residents, it is vital that the volunteers be acquainted with 
the connotations. Second part of the workcamp will be carrying out agricultural 
work in the organic farm located within the DMZ Peace & Life Valley.





Accommodation and food: You will be staying at a dormitory provided by the DMZ 
Peace & Life Valley foundation. The food will be served at the cafeteria only on 
Wednesday; you will need to prepare your own food on the rest of the days. 


     


Special requirements: The volunteers are expected to learn about DMZ prior to 
attending the workcamp as it carries a significant meaning to the local residents 
and work of this project.





Extra fee: None


Languages: English
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Languages: English


Airport: Incheon International Airport (ICN)


Train station: There is no train station. Volunteers must take Express Bus from 
Seoul to Inje.


Max vols per country: 2


Max national vols: 5





INSURANCE


KNCU provides insurance only for accidents during the Workcamp in Korea.
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Referencia: 12

KNCU04-14

Address:

125421Location:

JEONGSEONName:
Name:

2014Year:Code:

Url: www.unesco.or.kr

ART-KIDS  - Art camp-Work with kidsProject:

30Max Age:18Min Age:28/07/2014Final Date:15/07/2014Initial Date:

2Places:

Descripction of 
Workcamp:

Code: KNCU-04


Name: Jeongseon


Region: Jeongseon-gun, Gangwon-do


Country: Republic of Korea


Start date: 15 July 2014


End date: 28 July 2014


Type of work: ART/KIDS


Number of vols: 10


Min age: 18


Max age: 30


Partner: Jeongseon Arirang Cultural Foundation (Governmental Agency)





Work: UNESCO Intangible Cultural Heritage in December 2012


   


Accommodation and food:


       


Special requirements:





Extra fee: None


Languages: English


Airport: Incheon International Airport (ICN)


Train station: There is no train station nearby. Volunteers must take Express Bus 
from Seoul to Jeongseon. 


Max vols per country: 2


Max national vols: 5





INSURANCE


KNCU provides insurance only for accidents during the Workcamp in Korea.
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Ref.AgesCode Type Date PlacesWorkcamp

Codes Order

Corea Del Sur

CULTURE VILLAGE (CARTA DE 
MOTIVACIÓN)

 202/07/2014 - 14/07/2014YOUTHIWO71-14 18 - 30  1 

ACTIONS FOR A LOCAL (CARTA DE 
MOTIVACIÓN)

 215/07/2014 - 25/07/2014ENVIIWO72-14 18 - 30  2 

YOUTH EMPOWERING (CARTA DE 
MOTIVACIÓN)

 221/07/2014 - 02/08/2014YOUTHIWO73-14 18 - 30  3 

WORLD IN NATURE (CARTA DE 
MOTIVACIÓN)

 227/07/2014 - 09/08/2014YOUTHIWO75-14 18 - 30  4 

NATURE IS SCHOOL (CARTA DE 
MOTIVACIÓN)

 228/07/2014 - 09/08/2014YOUTH-CULTIWO77-14 18 - 30  5 

MOVE TO ENVIRONMENT (CARTA DE 
MOTIVACIÓN)

 228/07/2014 - 09/08/2014ENVIIWO78-14 18 - 30  6 

CREATIVE HILL (CARTA DE MOTIVACIÓN)  206/08/2014 - 25/08/2014ARTIWO83-14 18 - 30  7 

WORLD HERITAGE (CARTA DE 
MOTIVACIÓN)

 206/08/2014 - 16/08/2014CULTIWO84-14 18 - 30  8 

JEJU  208/07/2014 - 21/07/2014CULT-KIDSKNCU01-14 18 - 30  9 

MUAN  215/07/2014 - 28/07/2014ENVI-MANUKNCU02-14 18 - 30  10 

INJE  215/07/2014 - 28/07/2014AGRIKNCU03-14 18 - 30  11 

JEONGSEON  215/07/2014 - 28/07/2014ART-KIDSKNCU04-14 18 - 30  12 

Total Nº Campos:   12 Total Nº Plazas:  24 
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LIBRO CAMPOS PROYECTOS  2014

Ref.AgesCode Type Date PlacesWorkcamp

Dates Order

CULTURE VILLAGE (CARTA DE 
MOTIVACIÓN)

 202/07/2014 - 14/07/2014YOUTHIWO71-14 18 - 30  1 

JEJU  208/07/2014 - 21/07/2014CULT-KIDSKNCU01-14 18 - 30  9 
ACTIONS FOR A LOCAL (CARTA DE 
MOTIVACIÓN)

 215/07/2014 - 25/07/2014ENVIIWO72-14 18 - 30  2 

MUAN  215/07/2014 - 28/07/2014ENVI-MANUKNCU02-14 18 - 30  10 
INJE  215/07/2014 - 28/07/2014AGRIKNCU03-14 18 - 30  11 
JEONGSEON  215/07/2014 - 28/07/2014ART-KIDSKNCU04-14 18 - 30  12 
YOUTH EMPOWERING (CARTA DE 
MOTIVACIÓN)

 221/07/2014 - 02/08/2014YOUTHIWO73-14 18 - 30  3 

WORLD IN NATURE (CARTA DE 
MOTIVACIÓN)

 227/07/2014 - 09/08/2014YOUTHIWO75-14 18 - 30  4 

NATURE IS SCHOOL (CARTA DE 
MOTIVACIÓN)

 228/07/2014 - 09/08/2014YOUTH-CULTIWO77-14 18 - 30  5 

MOVE TO ENVIRONMENT (CARTA DE 
MOTIVACIÓN)

 228/07/2014 - 09/08/2014ENVIIWO78-14 18 - 30  6 

WORLD HERITAGE (CARTA DE 
MOTIVACIÓN)

 206/08/2014 - 16/08/2014CULTIWO84-14 18 - 30  8 

CREATIVE HILL (CARTA DE MOTIVACIÓN)  206/08/2014 - 25/08/2014ARTIWO83-14 18 - 30  7 

Total Nº Campos:   12 Total Nº Plazas:  24 
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